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A weekend in the Cotswolds
Escape into the wonderful Cotswolds for a

memorable weekend experience 

Bainton Bikes welcomes you to our weekend 
Cotswolds experience. 

Your tour is a 3-night stay with 2 days of cycling 
staying in the stunning thriving market town of More-
ton-in-Marsh. From this location we have two unique 
days of exploring the nearby towns, villages and 
historic sights. You will visit glorious natural beauty, 
hidden gems and fantastic locations to enjoy culinary 
delights. 

This tour is available as self-guided and we supply 
bikes, a very detailed travel guide and route (through a 

phone App) which includes points of interest to visit 
each day (with information) and recommendations for 
places to enjoy food and drink along the way. We are 
very proud of the local area and want you enjoy the 
best our beautiful area has to offer.

Each day has a circular cycling route offering a unique 
experience each day, starting and ending from your 
base in Moreton-in-Marsh.

Reservations 
For reservations and more information please contact 
us on the details below 
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A weekend in the Cotswolds

Such a wonderful way to spend a weekend

Your Arrival 

On arrival to your hotel we will leave a welcome pack 
which contains all the information about your holiday 
and destinations. 
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A weekend in the Cotswolds

Many beautiful locations to visit   

Day one 
Today we venture North from Moreton-in-Marsh 
passing through some of the best towns and villages 
within the Cotswolds. In the morning we start by first 
passing through the glorious Bourton-on-the-Hill 
offering fantastic views, with the opportunity to explore 
Batsford Arboretum and Sezincote House. You will 
slowly meander through the quiet countryside towards 
the fantastic village of Snowshill where you can visit 
the eccentric Snowshill Manor and Gardens. 

We continue after this to the sought after town of 
Broadway where we stop to explore the plentiful shops 
and enjoy some lunch in one of the many fine eateries, 
after lunch we climb to the nearby Broadway Tower 
which offers some of the best views within the area 
spanning across 16 counties. 

In the afternoon we visit some more beautiful towns 
and villages all offering a unique glimpse into Cotswold 
life. There are plenty of places to stop and enjoy a 
drink and a treat, along the way we will visit Chipping 
Campden, Broad Campden and Blockely before 
arriving back into Moreton-in-Marsh. 

Key facts
Distance: 36 miles / 58 km
Difficulty:  Medium 
Elevation gain: 2441 ft / 744 meters 



 

78 Walton Street | Oxford | OX2 6EA  
t: 01865 311610 | m: 07969 295502 m: 07903 938177 

e: info@baintonbikes.com | w: www.baintonbikes.com 
Open 7 days a week including bank holidays

Recommended 
on

A weekend in the Cotswolds

Spectacular views with unspoilt towns and villages

Day two 
Today’s route heads south exploring the rural side of 
the Cotswolds and provides you the opportunity to 
become one with nature as you head towards the 
ancient stone sights of the Rollright Stones. Here you 
can take time to walk among these historic monu-
ments and soak in the ambience of past descendants 
and traditions. 

We head to the town of Hook Norton, which is home to 
a Victorian Brewery. Here you can visit and take a 
guided tour of the brewery and sample the locally 
made produce. During the visit you may also see the 
famous brewery dray horses as they continue an age 
old tradition of delivering produce to the nearby 
taverns. For folks wishing for a shorter day today there 
is an option to miss the brewery. 

For lunch we arrive at the’ Cotswold hub’ of Chipping 
Norton, which offers a variety of shops, taverns, 
restaurants and cafes to tickle your fancy.

In the afternoon there are culinary delights waiting for 
you in the delightful village of Kingham and the 
award-winning Daylesford Farm shop, café and deli. 

We end the day riding off road through the countryside 
in Adlestrop Manor Grounds as you amble your way 
back into Moreton-in-Marsh.  

Key facts
Distance: 27 or 33 miles / 43 or 53 km (Shorter route 
option available today)
Difficulty:  Medium 
Elevation gain: 1400 or 1800 ft / 426 or 548 meters 


